



**Fayette County Public Schools
Purchasing Department**

205 LaFayette Avenue, LaFayette Educational Center,
Building A, Fayetteville, GA 30214
(770) 460-3535 ext. 1043 or purchasing@mail.fcboe.org

Notice of Intent to Award

Painting Projects for Fayette County Public Schools (IFB 21-016-075)

Thursday, May 13, 2021

The Fayette County Public Schools Purchasing Department would like to thank all respondents who participated in this solicitation.

The intent of this notice is to communicate the preliminary results of the selection process performed by the Purchasing Department and end-users. This is not an acceptance of your response, nor is it a confirmation of a contract or order. Based on the dollar value of this solicitation, final approval may be required from the Superintendent or the Board of Education as required by policy.

Selected Respondents:

A&D Painting Inc
2016 Tucker Industrial Road
Tucker, Georgia 30084

QUINTECH SOLUTIONS, INC
2550 Lithonia West Drive
Lithonia, Georgia 30058

Yates Painting, LLC
6657 Delaware Bend
Fairburn, Georgia 30213

Emory Contracting Service, LLC
103 Oakwood Lakes Drive
Hampton, Georgia 30228-2866

Award Term:

May 13, 2021 - December 31, 2021



Fayette County Public Schools Purchasing Department

205 LaFayette Avenue, LaFayette Educational Center,
Building A, Fayetteville, GA 30214
(770) 460-3535 ext. 1043 or purchasing@mail.fcboe.org

The following staff may be contacted for more information:

For project coordination including ordering and delivery:

Mike Satterfield

770-460-3522 and satterfield.mike@mail.fcboe.org

For contract/solicitation questions:

Jamie Marrero, Purchasing Associate

770-460-3522 or marrero.jamie@mail.fcboe.org

For accounts payable or billing information:

Finance Department, Accounts Payable

770-460-3535 or invoices.finance@mail.fcboe.org

| Respondent Name | Score | Facilities Services Project Cost | Score | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | Score | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | Score | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | Score | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | Score | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost | Score | Fair Rock Middle Project Cost | Score | LEC Building E Project Cost | Score | LEC Gym Project Cost | Score | LEC Some Auditorium Project Cost | Score | LEC Building C Project Cost | Score | LEC Building D Project Cost | Score | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | Score | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | Score | Warehouse Project Cost | Total Cost for all Projects Combined | | |
|--|-------|----------------------------------|-------|------------------------------------|-------|--------------------------------|-------|--|-------|-------------------------------------|-------|-----------------------------------|-------|-------------------------------|-------|---|-------|----------------------|-------|----------------------------------|-------|-----------------------------|-------|-----------------------------|-------|-------------------------------|---------------------|--------------------------------------|-------|------------------------|--------------------------------------|---------------|---------------|
| AD Painting Inc | 88.2 | \$470,000.00 | 96 | \$119,700.00 | 95 | \$32,450.00 | 95 | \$12,150.00 | 96 | \$12,600.00 | 87.5 | \$80,000.00 | 96 | \$23,440.00 | 95.5 | \$42,150.00 | 95 | \$19,200.00 | 88.9 | \$10,400.00 | 88.9 | \$10,400.00 | 72 | \$37,150.00 | 83 | \$34,900.00 | 96 | \$4,950.00 | 96 | \$14,400.00 | \$393,350.00 | | |
| Marlston Home & Business Solutions | 45.9 | \$105,070.50 | 47.3 | \$34,063.00 | 45.3 | \$38,866.50 | 62.9 | \$20,282.50 | 43.4 | \$42,214.00 | 47.3 | \$196,858.50 | 46 | \$63,161.00 | 0 | No Bid | 44 | \$136,405.00 | 35.6 | \$109,130.50 | 48.6 | \$24,737.00 | 42.1 | \$85,304.12 | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 51.8 | \$9,610.00 | 40.1 | \$575,680.00 | \$923,270.62 | | |
| Certapro Painters of Fayetteville | 94 | \$41,500.00 | 75.2 | \$16,750.00 | 72.6 | \$18,580.00 | 80.4 | \$15,250.00 | 79.7 | \$15,790.00 | 64.8 | \$125,450.00 | 84.3 | \$249,500.00 | 65.4 | \$15,200.00 | 94 | \$419,700.00 | 60.9 | \$38,790.00 | 53.1 | \$24,760.00 | 55 | \$57,800.00 | 70.6 | \$43,650.00 | 64.8 | \$7,380.00 | 64.8 | \$25,530.00 | \$513,350.00 | | |
| Quintech Solutions Inc | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 98 | \$9,350.00 | 98 | \$23,450.00 | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | \$32,800.00 |
| Caliber 1 Construction | 53.4 | \$88,956.00 | 52.1 | \$27,006.00 | 52.8 | \$27,624.00 | 52.1 | \$27,552.00 | 54.7 | \$25,914.00 | 50.8 | \$166,020.00 | 52.1 | \$48,480.00 | 57.3 | \$16,387.00 | 69 | \$59,742.00 | 57.3 | \$36,624.00 | 65.8 | \$14,262.00 | 50.8 | \$54,624.00 | 43 | \$91,848.00 | 44.3 | \$12,576.00 | 52.8 | \$31,260.00 | \$729,175.00 | | |
| Intercontinental Commercial Services Inc | 0 | No Bid | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | Bid Withdrawn |
| AW Paint & Decorating LLC | 0 | No Bid | 74 | \$17,104.00 | 70.8 | \$19,173.00 | 63 | \$22,603.00 | 65.6 | \$21,500.00 | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 72.1 | \$31,500.00 | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 69.5 | \$44,000.00 | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | \$155,880.00 |
| Yates Painting LLC | 67.2 | \$80,000.00 | 76.3 | \$18,400.00 | 75 | \$19,700.00 | 76.9 | \$18,400.00 | 75 | \$19,700.00 | 99 | \$70,000.00 | 83.8 | \$28,200.00 | 64.6 | \$18,000.00 | 94.5 | \$45,000.00 | 79.5 | \$27,200.00 | 67.8 | \$179,000.00 | 84.7 | \$30,000.00 | 99 | \$28,100.00 | 62.6 | \$9,200.00 | 78.9 | \$20,500.00 | \$450,300.00 | | |
| Enery Contracting Service LLC | 94.2 | \$45,400.00 | 94.8 | \$12,985.00 | 95.5 | \$13,400.00 | 88.3 | \$14,650.00 | 0 | Bid Withdrawn | 98.1 | \$71,565.00 | 95.5 | \$22,985.00 | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | 87.7 | \$34,560.00 | 0 | No Bid | 0 | No Bid | \$215,545.00 |
| | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | Total Cost of Awarded Projects Combined: | | | | | | | | | | | \$385,064.00 | | | | | | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|--|-----------------|---------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 31 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | \$47,060.00 |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | \$11,979.00 |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | \$12,465.00 |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | \$12,158.00 |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | \$12,465.00 |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | \$80,000.00 |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | \$21,414.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | \$8,552.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | \$42,155.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | \$19,232.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | \$10,483.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | \$37,156.00 |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | \$34,896.00 |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | \$4,095.00 |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | \$14,249.00 |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$368,359.00 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 31 |
| Notes: | Respondent provided three (3) references but bid submission did not include letters of recommendations, as requested, from these references. | -4 Points | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|---|-----------------|---------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 4 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 2.5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 2 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 24.5 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | \$105,070.50 |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | \$34,063.00 |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | \$38,866.50 |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | \$20,282.50 |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | \$42,214.00 |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | \$196,858.50 |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | \$63,161.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | \$136,405.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | \$109,130.50 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | \$24,737.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | \$85,304.12 |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | \$9,610.00 |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | \$57,568.00 |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$923,270.62 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 24.5 |
| Notes: | Respondent provided three (3) references but not three (3) letters of recommendation, as required. | -4 Points | |
| | Respondents Certificate of Insurance only provides a Combined Single Limit of \$500,000.00. Per our requirements the total coverage provided for Combined Single Limit needs to be \$1,000,000.00. | -1 Point | |
| | Respondent provided a Certificate of Insurance that does not list "Fayette County Public Schools" as certificate holder. | -2 Points | |
| | Respondent provided a list of project phases stating that the projects would take forty-five (45) days or less to complete. Respondent did not provide a detailed timeline with estimated start and end dates, as required. | -2.5 Points | |
| | Respondent did not provide "Square Footage" on Pricing Sheets. | -1 Point | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|--|-----------------|---------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 3 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 29 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | \$41,500.00 |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | \$16,750.00 |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | \$18,580.00 |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | \$15,250.00 |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | \$15,790.00 |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | \$125,450.00 |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | \$24,950.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | \$15,200.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | \$41,970.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | \$38,790.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | \$24,760.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | \$57,800.00 |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | \$43,650.00 |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | \$7,380.00 |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | \$25,530.00 |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$513,350.00 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 29 |
| Notes: | Respondent provided three (3) references but bid submission did not include letters of recommendations, as requested, from these references. | -4 Points | |
| | Respondent provided a "For Reference Only" Certificate of Insurance but does not meet the minimum requirements. The certificate holder should list "Fayette County Public Schools" | -2 Points | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|--|-----------------|--------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 6 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 3 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 33 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | No Bid |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | No Bid |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | \$9,350.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | \$23,450.00 |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$32,800.00 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 33 |
| Notes: | Respondent provided a "Proof Only" Certificate of Insurance but does not meet the minimum requirements. The certificate holder should list "Fayette County Public Schools" | -2 Points | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|--|-----------------|---------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Repondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 0 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 4.5 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 0 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 23.5 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | \$88,956.00 |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | \$27,006.00 |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | \$27,624.00 |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | \$27,552.00 |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | \$25,914.00 |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | \$166,020.00 |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | \$48,480.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | \$16,387.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | \$59,742.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | \$36,624.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | \$14,262.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | \$54,924.00 |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | \$91,848.00 |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | \$12,576.00 |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | \$31,260.00 |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$729,175.00 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 23.5 |
| Notes: | Respondent did not provide completed Submission Response Form, as required. | -2 Points | |
| | Respondent did not provide a detailed timeline, as required. | -5 Points | |
| | Respondent did not sign the pricing sheets, as required. | -.5 Points | |
| | Respondent provided three (3) references but bid submission did not include letters of recommendations, as requested, from these references. | -4 Points | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|--|-----------------|----------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 6 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 6.5 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 2.5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 3 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 30 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | No Bid |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | Bid Withdrawn |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | 0 |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 30 |
| Notes: | Respondent answered Question 3 on the Business Capability Form with references. Question 3 references information on current contracts in hand. | -5 Points | |
| | Respondent sent a request to withdraw the pricing for the Facilities Services project. ICS states that there was an error when calculating job cost. | | |
| | Respondent did not provide "Square Footage" on Pricing Sheets. | -1 Point | |
| | Respondent indicates on the Detailed Timeline the number of days to complete each project, but does not provide an estimated start and/or completion date. This information is vital when considering this project. The deadline for completion is August 1, 2021. | -2.5 Points | |
| | Respondent provided a "Insurance Verification Only" Certificate of Insurance but does not meet the minimum requirements. The certificate holder should list "Fayette County Public Schools" | -2 Points | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|--|-----------------|---------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 2.5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 28.5 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | No Bid |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | \$17,104.00 |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | \$19,173.00 |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | \$22,603.00 |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | \$21,500.00 |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | Bid Withdrawn |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | \$31,500.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | \$44,000.00 |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | No Bid |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$155,880.00 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 28.5 |
| Notes: | Respondent provided three (3) references but bid submission did not include letters of recommendations, as requested, from these references. | -4 Points | |
| | Respondent indicates on the Detailed Timeline the number of days to complete each project, but does not provide an estimated start and/or completion date. This information is vital when considering this project. The deadline for completion is August 1, 2021. | -2.5 Points | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|---|-----------------|---------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 6 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 4 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 34 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | \$80,000.00 |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | \$18,400.00 |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | \$19,700.00 |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | \$18,400.00 |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | \$19,700.00 |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | \$70,000.00 |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | \$28,200.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | \$18,000.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | \$45,000.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | \$27,200.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | \$17,900.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | \$30,000.00 |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | \$28,100.00 |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | \$9,200.00 |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | \$20,500.00 |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$450,300.00 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 34 |
| Notes: | Respondent did not provide "Square Footage" on Pricing Sheets. | -1 Point | |

| Reference | Specification | Points Possible | Points Awarded |
|---------------------------------------|---|-----------------|----------------------|
| <i>General Specifications Scoring</i> | | | |
| | Respondent has provided completed Response Submission Form, as required. | 2 | 2 |
| | Respondent has provided three (3) Letters of Recommendation, as required. | 6 | 6 |
| | Respondent has provided completed Business Capability Form, as required. | 7 | 7 |
| | Respondent has provided completed solicitation Pricing Sheet(s), as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a Detailed Timeline, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided a current Certificate of Insurance that meets minimum requirements. | 5 | 5 |
| | Respondent provided completed and notarized E-Verify Form, as required. | 5 | 5 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 35 | 35 |
| <i>Pricing Analysis</i> | | | |
| | Facilities Services Project Cost (East Fayette Elementary) | | \$45,400.00 |
| | Huddleston Elementary Project Cost | | \$12,985.00 |
| | Kedron Elementary Project Cost | | \$13,400.00 |
| | Peachtree City Elementary Project Cost | | \$14,650.00 |
| | Spring Hill Elementary Project Cost | | <i>Bid Withdrawn</i> |
| | Fayette Life Academy Project Cost (Previously Fayette Middle School) | | \$71,565.00 |
| | Flat Rock Middle Project Cost | | \$22,985.00 |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building E Project Cost | | <i>No Bid</i> |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Gym Project Cost | | <i>No Bid</i> |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Sams Auditorium Project Cost | | <i>No Bid</i> |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building C Project Cost | | <i>No Bid</i> |
| | LaFayette Educational Center (LEC) Building D Project Cost | | <i>No Bid</i> |
| | Sandy Creek High Project Cost | | \$34,560.00 |
| | Transportation/Bus Shop Project Cost | | <i>No Bid</i> |
| | Warehouse Project Cost | | <i>No Bid</i> |
| | Total Cost of Projects Combined | | \$215,545.00 |
| SECTION TOTAL | | 65 | |
| TOTAL TABULATED SCORE | | 100 | 35 |
| Notes: | | | |